
 

KONAMI DIGITAL ENTERTAINMENT CO., LTD 

ANNUAL TRANSPARENCY REPORT 

Konami Digital Entertainment Co., Ltd. (Konami, we or us) is required by Article 15 of the European 
Union’s Digital Services Act (Regulation (EU) 2022/2065, DSA) to publish an annual report on any content 
moderation we have engaged in over the previous year. 
 
This is Konami’s first annual transparency report of this type, covering the period 17 February 2024 to 16 
February 2025 (Reporting Period). 
 
A. Orders received from EU Member State authorities 
 
We are required to state the number of orders received from Member States’ authorities including orders 
issued in accordance with Articles 9 and 10 DSA, categorised by the type of illegal content concerned, the 
Member State issuing the order, and the median time needed to inform the authority issuing the order, or 
any other authority specified in the order, of its receipt, and to give effect to the order. 
 
Konami may receive orders from EU Member States, including orders requiring us to act against illegal 
content on our services or to provide information. 
 
Illegal content 
 
During the Reporting Period we received 0 orders from Member States’ authorities regarding illegal content. 
 
 
Orders to provide information 
 
During the Reporting Period we received 0 orders from Member States’ authorities to provide information. 
 
 
B. Illegal content notices received 
 
We are required to state the number of notices submitted in accordance with Article 16 DSA, categorised 
by the type of alleged illegal content concerned, the number of notices submitted by trusted flaggers, any 
action taken pursuant to the notices by differentiating whether the action was taken on the basis of the law 
or the terms and conditions of the provider, the number of notices processed by using automated means 
and the median time needed for taking the action. 
 
During the Reporting Period we received 0 notices regarding content which the reporters considered to be 
illegal. 
 
 
C. Own-initiative content moderation 
 
We are required to provide meaningful and comprehensible information about the content moderation 
engaged in at the providers’ own initiative, including the use of automated tools, the measures taken to 
provide training and assistance to persons in charge of content moderation, the number and type of 
measures taken that affect the availability, visibility and accessibility of information provided by the 
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recipients of the service and the recipients’ ability to provide information through the service, and other 
related restrictions of the service; the information reported shall be categorised by the type of illegal content 
or violation of the terms and conditions of the service provider, by the detection method and by the type of 
restriction applied. 
 
As well as receiving reports and complaints, KDE limits what content can be shared by users in particular 
by the automatic prohibition on our services of a large number of offensive or discriminatory words in a 
wide range of languages. 
 
D. Other content-related complaints received 
 
We are required to state the number of complaints received in the Reporting Period through the internal 
complaint-handling systems in accordance with the provider’s terms and conditions. 
 
During the Reporting Period we received 0 complaints through our internal complaints-handling systems 
about our content moderation decisions in accordance with our terms and conditions. 
 
E. Automated means of content moderation 
 
We are required to give details of any use made of automated means for the purpose of content moderation, 
including a qualitative description, a specification of the precise purposes, indicators of the accuracy and 
the possible rate of error of the automated means used in fulfilling those purposes, and any safeguards 
applied. 
 
We do not use automated means for content moderation. 
 
 
Date of report: 7 March 2025 

 
 
 


